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Once upon a time it was Halloween night and there
was a psychopath on Griffin Street. His name was Jack
Edwards. Jack had just moved to Santa Fe. The year
was 2024. But back in 1960, there was an incident that
happened on Griffin Street. A man had been terribly
murdered and the murderer took his eyes out. The police
were scattered across Griffin Street looking for the
murderer. There was one detective named Daryl. Daryl
got really far into the case and he was able to track down
the house of the murderer. “You're under arrest!” said
Daryl. The murderer got down on the floor but then he
saw the murderer slowly grab a gun. “Bam!” Daryl shot
the murderer. Later that night the murderer turned into a
ghost. The next day the ghost tracked down Daryl. He
killed his brother, then his parents, then he went after
Daryl.

The funeral of the first man who was murdered was
taking place. No one ever found his eyes because his
eyes were still with the ghost murderer. But the eyes were
still alive and turned into eye monsters. They went to the
man's funeral and put his eyes back in his head turning
him into a zombie. So the zombie tried hunting for the
murderer, but he didn’t know the murderer was a ghost.



The ghost summoned a demon who sent the zombie to
an infinite void but took his eyes and locked them in the
man’s house and then put a curse on the house. That
house was the exact same house Jack Edwards moved
into in 2024.

On Halloween night the eyes possessed Jack. Right
after they possessed him, there was a knock, knock, “trick
or treat!” The trick or treater was named Rowan. Since
Jack was possessed by the eyes he told him to come into
the house and said he had more candy inside. After that
he ended up murdering Rowan.

The next day everyone knew Rowan was missing.
His best friends Sarah and Michael were extremely
concerned. Since Jack was possessed by the eyes, the
next morning he went to Rowan’s neighborhood. He knew
Michael lived in Rowan’s neighborhood. And he knew
Michael would be home and Sarah would be there. Jack
sneaked into Michael’s house and possessed Sarah.
Then Jack was never to be seen again.

A year later, Michael was going to Sarah’s house to
go trick or treating. Sarah said she knew a good street for
good candy called Griffin Street. When they got to Jack’s
house, Michael didn’t know it was Jack’s house, but Sarah
did because she was possessed. When they knocked on
the door it just opened. Sarah pushed Michael in the
house and then the door slammed. Then the demon



came back and Michael would have been murdered until
Rowan came back. He was still alive. Rowan used Jack’s
sword to cut off the demon’s head. Then Michael went
missing.

Then in 2042, Sarah was an adult but she wasn’t
possessed anymore. That night she was taking her kids
trick or treating. It was their first time going, so she
decided to take them to Griffin Street to show them Jack’s
house. She decided to open the door and go in but left
her kids outside. She saw the demons head on the floor.
She called out Jack’s and Michael’s names. Then she
continued to go further into the house. She went up the
stairs and into the attic. She saw Michael and Rowan
chained up. Then the attic door slammed and they could
feel a dark presence in the room. Then they heard
screams and the door opened and a man in a detective
coat came through and slammed the door. He said “Hi I’m
Daryl, I’m here to rescue you.” He told Sarah to unchain
Rowan and Michael. Then the door slammed open and it
was Jack. Jack ripped the eyes out of Daryl. Daryl threw
an old book to Sarah and it was called “How to Defeat a
Ghost.” When they opened it, it had an ancient command
inside. They read the command out loud and Daryl
disintegrated. Then they heard many gunshots. They
looked out the window and saw Griffin Street burning
down………..TO BE CONTINUED….


